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731.370 Predetermined fixed rates for indirect costs.

Section 635(k) of the Foreign Assistance Act of 1961, as amended, authorizes USAID to use
predetermined fixed rates in determining the indirect costs applicable under contracts with
educational institutions.

731.371 Compensation for personal services.

(a) General. When establishing the workweek for employees overseas the contractor will take local
and USAID Mission practice into account and will ensure that the workweek is compatible with that
of those USAID Mission and Cooperating Country employees with whom the contractor will be
working.

(b) Salaries and wages.

(1) The policies set forth in (48 CFR) AIDAR 731.205-6(b) are also applicable to contracts with a
nonprofit organization.

(2) In considering consulting income as a factor when determining allowable salary for service under
a contract:

(i) For faculty members working under annual appointments, salary for service under the contract
may include the employee's on-campus salary plus “consulting income” (that is, income from
employment other than the employee's regular on-campus appointment, excluding business or other
activities not connected with the employee's profession) earned during the year preceding
employment under the contract.

(ii) For faculty members working under academic year appointments, salary for service under the
contract may include the employee's on-campus academic year salary plus “consulting income” as
defined above earned during the year proceeding employment under the contract, or salary for
service under the contract may be derived by annualizing the academic year salary (in which case
“consulting income” may not be included).

(3) USAID policies and compensation of third country national or cooperating country national
employees are set forth in (48 CFR) AIDAR 722.170.
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731.372 Fringe benefits.

USAID's policies on certain fringe benefits related to overseas service, including but not limited to
leave, holidays, differentials and allowances, etc. are set forth in the appropriate contract clauses in
(48 CFR) AIDAR 752.70.

731.373 Overseas recruitment incentive.

USAID's policies regarding overseas recruitment incentives are set forth in (48 CFR) AIDAR
731.205-70. These policies are also applicable to contracts with an educational institution.

731.374 Conference approval requirements.

USAID's policies regarding conference approval requirements are set forth in (48 CFR) AIDAR
731.205-43. These policies are also applicable to contracts with educational institutions.
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